
Location Call Number Title Author

LRC-MAIN
GC QA 267.3 .P48

2022

Automata theory and
formal languages:

fundamental notions,
theorems and

techniques

Alberto
Pettorossi

LRC-MAIN
GC Z 5643.C65

.K59 2019

Ethical and Secure
Computing: A Concise

Module 

Joseph Migga
Kizza

LRC-MAIN
GC QA 76.9.M35

.O74 2021

Guide to Discrete
Mathematics: An

Accessible Introduction
to the History, Theory,
Logic and Applications

Gerard O'Regan

LRC-MAIN
GC BJ 59 .T43

2023

Technology Ethics: a
philosophical

introduction and
readings

Gregory J.
Robson, and
Jonathan Y.

Tsou

LRC NEW
COLLECTION

LRC NEW
COLLECTION

lrc@national-u.edu.phhttps://lrckoha.national-u.edu.ph /NULRC @nu_lrc

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC-MAIN
GC T 10.5 .H39

2021

A research primer for
technical

communication :
methods, exemplars,

and analyses

George F.
Hayhoe and
Pam Estes

Brewer 

LRC - ANNEX
FIL LB 2806.I5

.F47 2022
The Teacher and the
School Curriculum

Madeline T.
Fernando  and
Erwin L.  Oamil

LRC - ANNEX
FIL HF 5549.5.T7

.S78 2022

The Student-Trainee's
Guide to the Internship
Program: An Outcomes-

Based Education
Approach

Richard C. Ampo,
Jenina V. Tolentino,

Ma. Cezanne D.
Dimaculangan, Victor

A. Estalilla Jr., Aubrey-
Ann L. Florencio, Maria

Joan P. Reyes and
Ernesto Thaddeus M.

Solmerano

LRC - ANNEX
FIL PE 1408 .M36

2022

A Modular Approach to
Teaching Grammar &

Composition 1:
Form,Meaning and Use

Jomel B.
Manuel

LRC - ANNEX
FIL JC 599.P6

.H86 2021
Human Rights

Education

Renato
M.Abastillas,Jr. , Eric

Paul D. Peralta,
Eleno O. Peralta and

Nephtaly Joel B.
Botor

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC - ANNEX
FIL LC 1203 .I43

2024

Inclusive Education in
Early Childhood

Settings

Helen B. Boholano,
Tizza Marie Menoria-

Navarro, Bernard
Evangelicom V. Jamon

and Venus M. Cortes

LRC - ANNEX
FIL GN 479.65

.G46 2024

Gender and society : concepts,
fundamental principles, and

methodologies for
comprehending gender

dynamics in the Philippines
towards fostering a more

efficient and highly gender-
sensitive society

Minsoware S. Bacolod,
Vida D. Jimenez, Dindo

R. Aseron, Najera R.
Umpar, Christian S.
Castillo and Joselito
Christian Paulus M.

Villanueva

LRC - ANNEX
FIL LB 3051 .M3

2024 c.1
Assessment of Learning

1
Jonathan L.

Mañas

LRC - ANNEX
FIL LB 3051 .M3

2024 c.2
Assessment of Learning

1
Jonathan L.

Mañas

LRC - ANNEX
FIL LB 2806.I5
.G35 2024 c.1

The teacher and the
school curriculum

Bernadette
Ortinero-

Gallardo and
Jonathan L.

Mañas

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC - ANNEX
FIL LB 2806.I5
.G35 2024 c.2

The teacher and the
school curriculum

Bernadette
Ortinero-

Gallardo and
Jonathan L.

Mañas

LRC - ANNEX
FIL LB 1775.4
.S27 2024 c.1

The Teaching
Profession in the 21st

Century

Darwin S.
Sarandi and
Michael R.

Babao

LRC - ANNEX
FIL LB 1775.4
.S27 2024 c.2

The Teaching
Profession in the 21st

Century

Darwin S.
Sarandi and
Michael R.

Babao

LRC - ANNEX
FIL LB 1775 .F47

2024 c.1
The Teaching

Profession

Madeline T.
Fernando,
Liezel A.

Concepcion and
Nina Christelle

M. Sumintac

LRC - ANNEX
FIL LB 1775 .F47

2024 c.2
The Teaching

Profession

Madeline T.
Fernando,
Liezel A.

Concepcion and
Nina Christelle

M. Sumintac

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC - ANNEX
FIL BF 199 .L86

2022
Understanding the Self

Alden Reuben
B.Luna

LRC - ANNEX
FIL LB 2806.15

.R66 2019
Curriculum

Development
Necy Cesaria

Vaquilar-Romo

LRC - ANNEX
FIL DS 668 .R43

2023
Readings in Philippine

History

Minsoware S.
Bacolod, Elieser

D. Nicolas,
Arnold Perona

Santos and
Francia

Formalejo Murao

LRC - ANNEX
FIL BJ 71 .E84

2023
Ethics

Minsoware S.
Bacolod, Jergen

Jel Cinco-Labaria,
Karen Salve Q.
Meorom-Maute

and Kharll Lewis
A. Quizon

LRC - ANNEX
FIL N 85 .S26

2023
Art Appreciation

Remedios A.
Sanchez,

Minsoware S.
Bacolod and

Conrado F. Vidal
Jr.

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC - ANNEX
FIL DS 675.8.R5

.S26 2024
The Life and Works of

Rizal 

Remedios A.
Sanchez,

Minsoware S.
Bacolod and

Najera R.
Umpar

LRC - ANNEX
FIL LB 2369 .B37

2022
Research Writing Made

Easy
Ma. Leticia Jose
Cabana-Basilan

LRC - ANNEX
FIL PE 1478 .B87

2024

Language Research 1: A
Comprehensive Guide
to Language Research

Methodology

Marinel V.
Burgos and

Mennen Pearl
C. Talibong

LRC - ANNEX
FIL PE 1128 .B37

2022 c.1
Reading and Writing

Skills
Ma. Leticia Jose
Cabana-Basilan

LRC - ANNEX
FIL PE 1128 .B37

2022 c.2
Reading and Writing

Skills
Ma. Leticia Jose
Cabana-Basilan

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC - ANNEX
FIL QA 93 .R49

2023
Mathematics in the

Modern World

Juan
Apolinario C.

Reyes

LRC - ANNEX
GC QA 76.575

.C67 2017

Multimedia
Foundations: Core

Concepts for Digital
Design 

Vic Costello

LRC - ANNEX
GC HF 5831 .S69

2017
Ethics in Advertising Wally Snyder

LRC - ANNEX
GC P 90 .E97

2017
Exploring

Communication Theory

Kory Floyd,
Paul Schrodt,
Larry Erbert
and Angela
Trethewey

LRC-MAIN
GC TA 345 .C43

2021 c.2
Numerical Methods For

Engineers Paperback

Steven Chapra
and Raymond

Canale

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC-MAIN
GC QA 76.9.C643

.P53 2022 c.2

Introduction to
Computer

Organization: An Under
the Hood Look at

Hardware and x86-64
Assembly

Robert Plantz

LRC-MAIN
GC QA 76.9.C643

.L43 2022 c.2

Modern Computer
Architecture and

Organization
Jim Ledin

LRC-MAIN
GC TK 7887 .T46

2019 c.2

A step-by-step
illustrative guide on
how to troubleshoot
Laptop and Pc: And
how to repair hard

drive

James Thomas

LRC-MAIN
GC QA 76.9.A43

.D43 2020
The bible of algorithms

& data structure
Florian Dedov

LRC-MAIN
GC QA 76.9.E94

.G74 2021

Systems performance :
enterprise and the

cloud
Brendan Gregg

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC-MAIN
GC QA 267 .I56

2021

Introduction to
Computation: Haskell,
Logic and Automata

Donald
Sannella,
Michael

Fourman,
Haoran Peng

and Philip
Wadler

LRC-MAIN
GC TR 267.5.A33

.P48 2022 c.1

Adobe Photoshop
Elements 2022 Illustrated

Guide: Upgrade your
Image Editing Skills Using

the Newly Released
Photoshop Elements

2022 

Kent Peterson

LRC-MAIN
GC TR 267.5.A33

.P48 2022 c.2

Adobe Photoshop
Elements 2022 Illustrated

Guide: Upgrade your
Image Editing Skills Using

the Newly Released
Photoshop Elements

2022 

Kent Peterson

LRC-MAIN
GC TK 5105.5

.N38 2020

Cisco CCNA Command
Guide: An Introductory

Guide for CCNA &
Computer Networking

Beginners

Ramon Nastase

LRC-MAIN
GC TK 5105.567

.N38 2021

IP Subnetting for
Beginners: Your

Complete Guide to
Master IP Subnetting in

4 Simple Steps

Ramon Nastase

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC-MAIN
GC LB 2369 .S24

2021 c.2

Student's Guide for
Final Year Project

Thesis: BSc, MSc, MA,
and MBA

Fadi Safieddine

LRC-MAIN
GC HD 30.37 .S48

2020

Understanding Service-
Oriented Architecture:

Designing Adaptive
Business Model for

SMEs 

Ashish Seth
and Kirti Seth

LRC-MAIN
GC TK 7887.5

.W55 2019

Essential computer
hardware : the

illustrated guide to
understanding

computer hardware

Kevin Wilson

LRC-MAIN
GC H 62 .W35

2022 c.2
Research Methods: The

Basics
Nicholas
Walliman

LRC-MAIN
GC TK 7887 .L44

2021 c.2

Troubleshooting & Fixing
Common Problems in PCs

& Laptops: A Quick
illustrative Guide to

Troubleshoot Repair,
Upgrade, and Optimize
your Computer System

Gilbert Lee

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC-MAIN
GC TR 897.5 .M47

2021

Animation For
Beginners: Getting

Started with Animation
Filmmaking 

Morr Meroz

LRC-MAIN
GC QA 76.9.D338

.F47 2022

The Data Integration
Guide: How to design,
deliver, deploy, and

sustain efficient data
integration solutions in

your information
system

Ahmed Fessi

LRC-MAIN
GC QA 76.9.S63
.B37 2017 c.2

Fundamental of Soft
Computing

Kuntal Barua
and Prasun
Chakrabarti

LRC-MAIN
GC TK 5105.5

.S36 2019

CompTIA Network+ A
Comprehensive

Beginners Guide to
Learn About The

CompTIA Network+
Certification from A-Z

Walker
Schmidt

LRC-MAIN
GC TK 5105.5
.S368 2019

Networking for Beginners:
An Easy Guide to Learning
Computer Network Basics.

Take Your First Step, Master
Wireless Technology, the
OSI Model, IP Subnetting,

Routing Protocols and
Internet Essentials

Russell Scott

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC-MAIN
GC TK 5105.8864

.E76 2022

A Beginners Guide to the
Metaverse: A Simple Manual
to Understanding Web 3.0,
Augmented Reality, Virtual

Reality, Non-Fungible Token
(NFT), Digital Assets and

Investing in the Metaverse

Eddie S. Erhart

LRC-MAIN
GC TK 5105.5
.K57 2020 c.2

Computer Networking: An
All-in-One Beginner's Guide

to Understanding
Communications Systems,
Network Security, Internet
Connections, Cybersecurity

and Hacking

Quinn Kiser

LRC-MAIN
GC QA 76.758
.L68 2021 c.2

Software Engineering
for Absolute Beginners:
Your Guide to Creating

Software Products

Nico Loubser

LRC-MAIN
GC TA 190 .N59

[2022] c.2

Practical Project
Management: Proven

Framework That Great
Project Managers Use

In the Real World

Dmytro
NizhebetskyI
and Andrew

Dawson

LRC - MAIN
GC QA 76.6 .S36

2019 c.2
Computer networking Russell Scott

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC - MAIN
GC QA 76.76.H94

.D66 2022

Learn Enough HTML,
CSS and Layout to Be

Dangerous: An
Introduction to Modern
Website Creation and
Templating Systems

Lee Donahoe
and Michael

Hartl

LRC - MAIN
GC HV 8079.C65

.T76 2020 c.2

Hunting Cyber
Criminals: A Hacker's

Guide to Online
Intelligence Gathering
Tools and Techniques

Vinny Troia

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.X53 2024

Assessing the
implementation of

management by objectives
based on the cipp

evaluation model in the
higher education context:

the case of a private
university in China

Yang Xiaolei

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.G86 2024

Examining student
leadership skills of

students in a Chinese
university: basis for

the student leadership
development model

Zhao Guognang

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.R49 2024

Teaching practices and
strategies in a

multilingual setting:
implications on

instructional leadership

Christian
Lawrence N.

Reyes

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.F45 2024

An assessment of the
experiences of

university teachers on
the use of artificial

intelligence in classes
towards enhanced AI-

mediated classes

Wang Feifei

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.N38 2024

Revisiting the english
language proficiency of

HEI faculty and
administrative support

staff: a basis for
sustainable program in

conversational skills

Rocel Angelie C.
Navarro

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.L58 2024

Assessing the
implementation of

community education
in learning cities of
Manila and China
towards model
development

Ting Liu

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.D65 2024

Teachers perception
and practices in
implementing

classroom-based
reading programs:

supervisory approach
for mastering teaching

Sammy Q.
Dolba

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.B68 2024

Developing an
innovative fitness

framework: a teaching
andragogy in pathfit

curriculum

Anna Leigh
Barcelon
Botones

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.X534 2024

Comprehensive analysis
of China's higher

vocational education
talent cultivation policy:

basis for policy
implementation

framework

He Xichun

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.L56 2024

Success stories of the
education graduates of

normal schools in
Western China towards

creating a teacher
training program

Su Limei

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.N86 2024

Challenges and
opportunities of

distance education to
Filipino offshore

graduate students:
basis for management

enhancement

Jayrome Lleva
Nunez

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.J86 2024

Practices and challenges
of grassroots teaching

organization in
universities in Liaoning

Province: basis for
strategy development

framework

Ni Jun

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.V55 2024

Employment practices
assessment towards

the development of a
faculty sustainability

program for local
colleges in Bulacan

Mary Grace M.
Villaflores

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.M35 2024

Leadership competencies
and resiliencies of school
administrators: basis for
improved organizational

performance and
governance

John Marie E.
Malco

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.L564 2024

Examining the gap
between software

technology curriculum
and industry demand:
basis for an enhanced

curriculum

Lyu Ling

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.Z43 2024

Exploring counselor's
competency in higher
vocational college in

China: basis for
competency model

construction

Bo Zhang

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.W36 2024

Transformation of
school leadership style
of Chinese universities

in the new normal

Zhijun Wang

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.J56 2024

Aesthetic experiences
of students in physical
education courses as
input to curriculum

enhancement

Ana Marie L.
Jimenez

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.H85 2024

Analysis of the professional
development program of

general foundation course
teachers in higher

vocational college in China:
basis for the teacher

professional development
framework

Wang Huiling

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.W364 2024

The college teachers
implementation of outcome-
based teaching and learning
in the new media classroom

environment: basis for a
framework for teacher

effectiveness

Wang E

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.M36 2024

Emotional quotient of
at-risk adolescents in
Mandaluyong: towars
the development of
self-enhancement

program

Leah San
Antonio Manio

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.C35 2024

Stress and coping
strategies of high

performing and low
performing students in

hyblend space: basis
for psychosocial
support program

Emilson
Comandante

Caindoy

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.O45 2024

Effects of national
university educators's

performance on the
school

internationalization:
basis for a proposed

development plan for
internationalization

Rufino C. Oliva

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.Y88 2024

Examining the
implementation of higher

vocational education
reform in China :a:

challenges,opportunities
and policy implications

Jie Yutong

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.W8 2024

The mental health
condition of Chinese art

college students in
China: basis for

developing a
psychosocial support

framework

Yunjian Wu

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.S53 2024

Practices of teachers on
the use of

translanguaging
pedagogy towars a

proposed instructional
design framework in

business english

Xiudong Shao

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.V53 2024

Preschool teachers'
online assessment

practices in the new
normal: the mediating
role of teacher agency

Kharisma F.
Vicente

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.G36 2024

E-leadership readiness
of academic leaders in
higher institutions in

China: a
phenomenological

study

Yanjun Gao

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.A46 2024

Development and
validation of a

retention model for
academic librarians in
university belt higher
education institutions

Editha Agena
Alamodin

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.G36a 2024

Art education
management in the

new media era: basis
for implementation

strategies

Shengfei Gao

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CEAS EDD
.G36s 2024

Student engagement in
fully online learning

environment: basis for
strategies to improve

academic retention

Luyun Gao

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CCIT PhDCS
.H66 2024

Personalized
recommendation

method in massive
open online courses

based on deep learning
algorithm and attention

mechanism

Yuan Hongli

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CCIT PhDCS
.H4 2024

Research of sentiment
tendency analysis of
film reviews based

based on deep learning

Aixiang He 

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CCIT PhDCS
.Z43 2024

The application of
integrating knowledge

graph and
recommendation

method in intelligent
education

Yiwen Zhang 

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CCIT PhDCS
.D54 2024

Online learning status
recognition method

based on facial
expression

Xuejing Ding 

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CCIT PhDCS
.Y36 2024

Prediction method of
user coupon usage
based on BiLSTM

Lisha Yao 

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CCIT PhDCS
.M46 2024

Explainable health fake
news detection on

social media
Xiu Ping Men 

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CCIT PhDCS
.Z436 2024

Intelligent movie
recommender system

using deep learning
technique

Qi Zhang 

February



Location Call Number Title Author

LRC -
GRADUATE

STUDIES

GSD CCIT PhDCS
.A5 2024

Hybrid attention-based
artificial intelligence

model in human action
recognition

Xiaofeng An 

TOTAL : 100

If you would need the contents of each books, we may send it to
you through our Document Delivery Service!     

You may send your requests through:  

Email: lrc@national-u.edu.ph
FB Page:  https://www.facebook.com/NULRC

Instagram, X(twitter) and Tiktok:@nulrc


